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صخلملا

ركبملاةيريرسلاتاراهملاسيردتجاردإنمسيئرلاضرغلانإ:ثحبلافادهأ
تاراهميفةربخلاباستكابمهلحامسلاوهةيريرسلاةلحرملالبقامبلاطل
ملعتويضرملاخيراتلاذخأو،ةيساسلأاةيبطلاتاءارجلإاو،يريرسلاصحفلا
تاراهملاسيردتةيلعافديدحتىلإةساردلاهذهفدهتو.يبطلالصاوتلاتاراهم
.ةيريرسلاتاونسللبطلابلاطدادعإيفركبملاةيريرسلا

ةيلعافنمققحتللةثلاثلاةنسلاببطلابلاطىلعهنابتساتعزو:ثحبلاقرط
.ىلولأاةيريرسلاةنسلايفبلاطلاىلعركبملاةيريرسلاتاراهملاسيردت
عمتركيلسايقمبميقتطاقنسمخىلعيوتحتدونبةينامثنمهنابتسلاانوكتت
.حوتفمدحاولاؤس

نم)٪٧٠.٨(٩٧ىدبأو.٪٦٢ةبسنبهنابتسلالبلاطلاةباجتساتناك:جئاتنلا
قفاودقو.ركبملاةيريرسلاتاراهملاسيردتةيجيتارتسانعمهاضربلاطلا

ةيريرسلالبقةلحرملايفجمانربلانمةلصاحلاةدئافلاىلعبلاطلانم٪٩٠.٥

ةيباجيإلعفدودربلاطلاىدبأو.مهبةصاخلاةيريرسلاتاونسللمهدادعلإ
،ةيساسلأاةيبطلاتاءارجلإاو،يريرسلاصحفلاتاراهميفةربخلامهباستكلا
.ىضرملاونيفرشملاعميبطلالصاوتلاتاراهمملعتويضرملاخيراتلاذخأو
ةيريرسلاتاراهملاسيردتجمانربنعاضرلامدعبلاطلانميأدِبيملو
.ركبملا

اديجركبملاةيريرسلاتاراهملاسيردتلبلاطلالبقتناك:تاجاتنتسلاا
ءزجركبملاةيريرسلاتاراهملاسيردتربتعيو.ةيريرسلاتاونسللمهدادعلإ
ةلصاوميغبنيو،ةيريرسلاتاونسلالبقامةلحرمللةيساردلاجهانملانمايويح
،بلاطلاىدلةقثلاىوتسمزيزعتلىفشتسمللةرركتملاتارايزلاعمهريوطت
.ةيريرسلاتاونسلاللاخىضرملاعممهلماعتدنعءادلأاو

؛هنابتسا;ةيريرسلالبقامتاونس;ةيريرسلاتاراهملاملعت:ةيحاتفملاتاملكلا
يريرسلاصحفلا;يضرملاخيراتلاذخأ;كاردلإا

Abstract

Objectives: The main purpose of the early introduction

of Clinical Skills Learning (CSL) to pre-clinical years is to

allow medical students to gain experience in clinical ex-

amination skills, basic medical procedures, history-taking

and clinical communication. The objective of this study

was to determine the effectiveness of the early teaching of

clinical skills in preparing medical students for their

clinical years.
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Methods: A validated questionnaire assessing the value

of CSL on students in their first clinical year was

distributed to 3rd year medical students. The question-

naire consisted of 8 items with a five-point Likert scale

and one open-ended question.

Results: The response rate to the questionnaire was

approximately 62%. Nearly 97 (70.8%) students sug-

gested that CSL was a favourable teaching strategy. A

high percentage of students (90.5%) agreed that CSL was

a useful pre-clinical module to prepare them for their

clinical years. The students gave positive feedback on the

teaching of history-taking and physical examination,

exposure to the hospital environment and acquisition of

communication skills with supervisors and patients. No

student perceived the CSL module as poor.

Conclusions: Early CSL was well-perceived by students in

preparing them for their clinical years. CSL is a vital part

of the pre-clinical curriculum and should be further

enriched with frequent hospital visits to enhance students’

confidence level and performance when interacting with

patients during their clinical years.
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Introduction

Skill is defined as the ability to perform a task and is

related to competency.1,2 Clinical skills range from skills in
history taking, physical examination, and performing
procedures to communication and interpretation.3,4

The Clinical Skills Learning (CSL) Committee of the
Faculty of Medicine of Universiti Kebangsaan Malaysia
(UKM) was formed in 2005 with the introduction of a CSL

module during the preclinical years as a new component of
the medical undergraduate curriculum. The committee is
under the Department of Medical Education, which is
directly involved in the development of the curriculum of the

Faculty of Medicine. It is also responsible for managing and
coordinating the formulation and implementation of the
medical education curriculum.

The CSL committee is headed by a senior clinician as the
chairperson. Other members include a deputy chairperson
and the heads and assistant heads of the CSL modules for

each semester. The committee monitors CSL activities, ex-
aminations and curriculum reviews. It is also responsible for
overseeing the skills learning programme and is charged with

curriculum development roles to ensure congruence between
clinical skills and other elements of the curriculum.

Several supporting staff members of the Department of
Medical Education were assigned to assist the CSL com-

mittee. There is an administrator who is responsible for the

day-to-day operational control and running of the CSL ac-
tivities. The administrator also monitors the use of the fa-

cility as a learning resource. There is a coordinator for
standardised patients (actors or volunteers) who is respon-
sible for maintaining a database of standardised patients

who will be used for the learning and assessment of clinical
skills. Several technicians are available to maintain and
ensure the availability of the models, manikins and other

clinical diagnostic and therapeutic equipment required for
skills learning activity.

The activities in each CSL module are coordinated by the
head of the module and an assistant. The teaching staff

consists of clinicians from various departments. They pro-
vide support for the learning activities. Because the staff
members come from different clinical backgrounds, training

workshops are organised prior to the start of each semester
by the CSL committee to train them on the characteristics of
being a ‘good teacher.’ The workshops also standardise the

methods of the delivery of the module contents and an
evaluation of the students’ clinical skills. Lecturers from the
nursing department are also involved in the CSL module as
clinical skills instructors of specific procedures. The assis-

tance provided by the Nursing department is valuable
because studies have shown that the teachings of nurse tutors
in CSL programme were well received by the students.5

Early exposure to clinical skills teaching helps to inte-
grate students’ knowledge in basic sciences with clinical
concepts. This integration enhances students’ understanding

and interest. The CSL module also equips the students with
skills in history taking and physical examination in prepa-
ration for their clinical years. It improves students’ confi-

dence in clinical skills, such that they become less self-
conscious and can give their full concentration in perform-
ing their clinical skills. This would translate into an increase
in students’ problem solving skills, clinical reasoning, com-

petency and action plans.6,7 In a study involving several
medical faculties, students scored a higher average mark
when the CSL module was introduced during the clinical

years.8

The objective of the study is to determine third year stu-
dents’ evaluation of the CSL module in terms of preparing

them for their clinical years.

Material and Methods

The Faculty of Medicine of UKM has a 5-year under-
graduate medical programme. The Clinical Skill Learning

(CSL) module was first introduced during the preclinical
years for the 2005/2006 session of the medical undergraduate
curriculum. The CSL focuses on teaching skills in history

taking and physical examination and allows clinical learning
to occur in a safe classroom setting. Prior to 2005, these basic
clinical skills were taught in an intensive 8-week course

before the students entered their third year.
The students were divided into several small CSL teaching

groups, with each group consisting of eight to ten students,

which was facilitated by a clinical lecturer. Each CSL session
was conducted every fortnight, with each session lasting for
3 h. The CSL sessions used various learning methods,
including demonstrations, video-watching, role-playing and

interactive sessions with standardised patients and patients
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