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صخلملا

ةحارجليدوعسلاصاصتخلااجمانربببيردتلاىوتسممييقت:ثحبلافادهأ
يفىرخلأازكارملاوضايرلابيردتزكرمنيبةنراقملمعوماعلكشبماظعلا
.ةيدوعسلاةيبرعلاةكلمملا

اًبيبط٣٢وضايرلازكرمنماًميقماًبيبط٣٨ةساردلايفكراش:ثحبلاقرط
بناوجلامهأنعتانابتساةئبعتباوماقثيح،ىرخلأابيردتلازكارمنم
.بيردتلابةقلعتملاةيساسلأا

يبردتمىدلرثكأةصصختملاةيملعلاتلاجملاةءارقىلعلابقلإاناك:جئاتنلا
بتكلاةءارقىلعمهلابقإديازتنيذلا،ضايرلاجراخمهئلامزبةنراقم،ضايرلا
لاجميفبيردتلاةيافكمدعدوجوعلاطتسلاارهظأدقو.)٠.٠٢٨¼P(ةيملعلا
ةيافكمدعكلذكو،ضايرلازكرمبنيميقملاءابطلألةبسنلابثداوحلاوتاباصلإا
.ضايرلاجراخزكارملابنيبردتملاىدلىرخلأاةقيقدلاتاصصختلايفةيبسن
نودهنأببيردتلانعضايرلاجراخنيبردتملاءابطلأامظعمعابطناناكو
.)٠.٠٢١¼P(ضايرلازكرميفمهؤارظنهافنيذلارملأا،بولطملاىوتسملا
يقيقحلاىوتسملاةرورضلابسكعتلاناحتملااةجردنأبةيبلغلأايأرناكو
،جمانربللةيبيردتلاةقاطلاقوفتتتابةديازتملانيبردتملادادعأنأو،بردتملل
ةيحاننمنيبردتملانيبركذيقرفدوجوةساردلاجئاتنرهظتملماعلكشبو
.بيردتلامامتإدعبةيساسلأاةيمظعلاتاحارجلابمايقللةيفاكلاةراهملاكلاتما

،نيميقملاءابطلأاعيمجلوانتميفنوكتنأبجيةيملعلاةداملا:تاجاتنتسلاا
قيرفلاءاضعأعنمبجي.نيبردتملامدقتةعباتملنيفرشمنييعتلضفيكلذكو

لاأبجي.هيلعبيردتلاصرفعييضتوأبردتملاقوقحىلعيدعتلانميبطلا
بجينيبردتملاءارآ.جمانربللةيبيردتلاةردقلاباعيتسانيبردتملادادعأزواجتت
نيرصقملانيبردملاةفرعمجمانربلابةيملعلاةنجللامزليكلذكو،مرتحتنأ
اهيفبردتملاىقلتيلايتلاةقيقدلاتاصصختلاديدحتبجيامك.مهتبساحمو
ليجستبيتكمدختسينأنكميو.اهيفةجاحلادسىلعلمعلاوبولطملاىوتسملا
ةنجلىلعو،ةنيعمتاصصختيفبردتملاءافتكلاسايقمكةيحارجلاتلااحلا
ديعاوموبيلاسأيفةرركتملاوةئجافملاتارييغتلابنجتجمانربلابتاناحتملاا
.تاناحتملاانكامأو

صاصتخلااجمانرب;بيردتجمانرب;يبطميلعت;مييقت:ةيحاتفملاتاملكلا
بيردتلا;ماظعلاةحارجليدوعسلا

Abstract

Objective: To evaluate the training quality of the Saudi

Orthopedic Residency Program in general, and to

compare the Riyadh training center with other training

centers in Saudi Arabia.

Methods: A group of 38 residents from Riyadh and 32

residents from other centers in Saudi Arabia were sur-

veyed in a cross-sectional manner. The participants

completed carefully designed questionnaires pertaining to

the most critical issues of their training.

Results: Reading peer-reviewed, scholarly articles was

more popular with trainees in Riyadh compared with

trainees working outside Riyadh, for whom textbooks

were the dominant educational resource (P ¼ 0.028). The

data revealed insufficiencies in surgical training in the

trauma discipline in Riyadh and relative deficiencies of

surgical experience in subspecialties outside of Riyadh. In

contrast to residents trained outside of Riyadh, Riyadh

trainees denied having a weak level of training
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(P ¼ 0.021). Examination scores did not reflect the actual

level of resident competency according to the residents’

responses. The program’s capacity could not accommo-

date the growing number of trainees. Both groups re-

ported similar levels of expertise with regard to the basic

orthopedic operative skills.

Conclusion: Educational resources should be within the

reach of all residents. Senior supervisors should not

compromise resident training. The number of trainees

should be proportional to program capacity. Resident

feedback should not be neglected, and the program

committee must recognize delinquent trainers and protect

the trainees from them. Deficient areas of training should

be identified and rectified. A case logbook may be used as

an indicator of surgical exposure. Frequent changes to

examination formats, dates and locations should be

avoided.
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Introduction

The Saudi Commission for Health Specialties (SCFHS)
is the authorized administrative body that grants accredi-

tation to the local training institutions and controls the
qualification of healthcare workers in Saudi Arabia. In
addition, SCFHS directly supervises the post-graduate local
training in different medical fields. Orthopedic surgery

training is the responsibility of the Saudi Orthopedic Res-
idency Program, which is in turn ruled by SCFHS. Saudi
Orthopedic Residency Program has branches in the major

Saudi cities and the training is only performed in the
accredited training institutes. Training of residents who
belong to a particular program is typically based locally in

their main center. The minimum duration of orthopedic
training is five years and trainees are evaluated regularly
during each rotation. The evaluation of the resident is the
responsibility of the attending physician who records the

level achieved by the trainee according to a specific scale
given in the resident evaluation form. The resident evalu-
ation form basically tests 4 main training domains;

knowledge, clinical skills, operative skills and personality
and ethics. Residents must pass a requisite examination at
the end of each training year to be promoted to the next

level of training. After completion of the fifth training year,
the trainee becomes board eligible. Candidates who pass the
theoretical and clinical sections of the final exam are

certified by the Saudi Board of Orthopedic Surgery (SB-
Orth).

However, deficiencies in healthcare systems may lead to
serious consequences for the health of the population;

therefore, there is little doubt as to why many governments

devote considerable attention and effort to develop these
systems. The aptitude of medical practitioners is an essential

part of a healthcare system, which is directly related to the
quality of training and the licensing process. Governmental
awareness of the importance of medical education has

resulted in significant changes in healthcare systems to
optimize medical training. In 1996, the Royal College of
Physicians and Surgeons of Canada adopted the guidelines

of the Canadian Medical Education Directions for Special-
ists (CanMEDS).1 Similarly, the regulations of the
Accreditation Council for Graduate Medical Education
(ACGME) were implemented in the United States in

1999,2e4 and the Australian government formulated the
Australian Curriculum Framework for Junior Doctors in
2006.5,6

The recent expansion of the Saudi Orthopedic Residency
Program in terms of the number of trainees and training
institutions has had a remarkable effect on the quality of

training. The aim of the present study was to investigate the
current status of training of the Saudi Orthopedic Residency
Program from the residents’ perspective and to compare
feedback from Riyadh residents regarding training quality

with the impression of their peers outside of Riyadh.

Methods

A proposal for the present study was reviewed and
approved by the institutional review board. A cross-sectional
study was conducted from 2011 to 2012 among residents

enrolled in the Saudi Orthopedic Residency Program. In-
vitations to participate in the study were sent by email to 90
residents who represented almost all the senior in-training

orthopedic residents in Saudi Arabia. 40 residents were
from Riyadh center whereas the remaining 50 were trained
outside of Riyadh. Seventy residents completed the ques-
tionnaire and returned them back to the research team with

about 78% overall response rate. Thirty-eight residents out
of the 40 Riyadh residents and 32 residents out of the 50
whose training was based outside of Riyadh completed the

survey questionnaires. The response rates were around 95%
and 64% in Riyadh and outside of Riyadh, respectively.

Junior residents in their first and second years of training

were excluded because of their limited orthopedic experi-
ence. The questionnaire consisted of 27 items arranged in six
sections. The questions were closed-ended with multiple-
choice answers. The questionnaire was carefully formu-

lated by a group of experts to examine the most critical
aspects of the training process and included demographic
data, academic educational activities, operative skills

training, teaching staff aptitude, exams and trainee’s overall
self-satisfaction.

Statistical analysis was performed using SPSS version 19

(IBM Corporation, USA). The questionnaire’s reliability
was verified through test-retest study. P values were obtained
using c2 and Fisher’s exact tests; P < 0.05 was considered to

be statistically significant.

Results

Participants in each group were distributed evenly based

on their level of training. Although textbooks represented the
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