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a b s t r a c t

This contribution aims to highlight the diversity in European qualitative management research as a way
of celebrating its ongoing development within Europe. In recognising the strengths that emerge from
this diversity in epistemological traditions and methods, attention is drawn to the concerns increasingly
expressed by qualitative researchers about growing pressures of standardisation. It is argued that
qualitative researchers should take every opportunity to encourage methodological diversity whilst
resisting attempts at homogenising the experience and reporting of qualitative management research.
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1. Introduction

The contribution of qualitative research methods to our under-
standing of organization and management is now accepted
(Buchanan & Bryman, 2007), and lately a number of authors have
reflected upon the progress that qualitative management research
has made into the mainstream (e.g. Bluhm, Harman, Lee, &
Mitchell, 2011; Symon, Cassell, & Johnson, 2016). What is meant
by qualitative research is a somewhat ‘contested terrain’ (Johnson,
Buehring, Symon, & Cassell, 2007: 37), indeed as Locke (2003: 19)
highlights the domain of qualitative research is plural if not
potentially confusing to the newcomer. An all-encompassing defi-
nition is provided by Alvesson and Deetz (2000:1) who suggest:
“Qualitative research has become associated with many different
theoretical perspectives, but it is typically oriented to the inductive
study of socially constructed reality, focusing on meanings, ideas
and practices, taking the native's point of view seriously”.

It is important to recognise that whereas there are many com-
monalities in quantitative methods, there is considerable variety in
qualitative management research. Notably for this paper, it is
pertinent that the use of qualitative research in North America,
Europe and the rest of the world has developed at different rates
and been informed by different traditions (Lee & Humphrey, 2006).
For example Üsdiken (2014) notes that there is less qualitative
research published in US journals than their European alternatives.

Bengtsson, Eld and Lind (1997) suggest that the transatlantic gap is
also about methodological approaches in that European research is
more frequently idiographic and processual whereas in contrast US
research is dominated by nomothetic approaches with their
emphasis upon quantitative analysis across large samples to test
hypotheses. Moreover, we know that there are different traditions
of qualitative management research within Europe itself, for
example Knoblauch et al. (2002:2) when discussing the variety of
qualitative research in Europe highlight how scientific enterprises
such as qualitative research are imprinted by cultures e and not
only by ‘epistemic cultures’, but also by their surrounding in-
stitutions, traditions and political as well as economic contexts.
They suggest that in the European context this has become partic-
ularly visible in countries which have passed through a communist
era such as Poland and Slovenia where the impact of the specific
national traditions of thinking on qualitative methods can be seen.

In this paper I aim to do two things. The first is to highlight the
diversity in European qualitative management research as a way of
celebrating its ongoing development within Europe. In recognising
the strengths that emerge from this diversity in epistemological
traditions and methods, the second aim is to draw attention to the
concerns increasingly expressed by qualitative researchers about
growing pressures of standardisation (Mingers & Willmott, 2013;
Symon, Johnson and Cassell, 2016). I conclude by arguing that
qualitative researchers should take every opportunity to encourage
methodological diversity whilst resisting attempts at homogenis-
ing the experience and reporting of qualitative management
research.
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2. The diversity of European qualitative management
research

Whereas there is considerable consistency in the philosophical
roots that underpin quantitative approaches, qualitative methods
are informed by a wide range of different epistemological and
ontological traditions. European thinkers have been central to the
development of these paradigms, for example the role of European
critical theorists includingMarx, Gramsci, Bordieu and Habermas in
underpinning the development of traditions (Hassard& Rowlinson,
2011) which still dominate the field of critical management studies.
Whole movements in qualitative research such as postmodernism
and post-structuralism have been underpinned by the work of
European philosophers such as Foucault, Derrida and Lacan. This
diversity in epistemological traditions originating in Europe
perhaps partially accounts for the friendliness of European journals
to such diverse approaches when compared to the US counterparts
(Bluhm et al., 2011). The European openness to qualitative research
also extends to the publication of a variety of different methods
(Bluhm et al., 2011).

There is also considerable diversity in developments in quali-
tative research in different parts of Europe. To take some examples,
Angermüller (2006) suggests that in France although qualitative
approaches are used there is little preference for the term ‘quali-
tative’ because it implies that a certain kind of methodology is
being privileged over another. This is different to Germany where
there has long been a clear split betweenwhat are seen as hard and
soft sciences with a resulting impact on the development of qual-
itative research (Angermüller, 2006). A somewhat different sce-
nario has occurred in the Ukraine where Baranchenko and
Yukhanaev (2013) highlight a number of problems with publish-
ing qualitative research including unfamiliarity with methods; lack
of understanding about different philosophies; and history and
traditions which focus upon numbers and formulae. The authors
suggest that one of the underlying problems to the use of qualita-
tive research is that structural changes in the Ukraine system of
higher education have meant that pressure is put on academics to
publish in only approved national journals which have been
through a rigorous approval procedure with the Ministry of Edu-
cation. This is similar to the pressures that emerge from journal
quality rankings that have been noted elsewhere in Europe
(Mingers & Willmott, 2013). As they highlight:

“Given the tradition of positivism and quantitative research
methodology together with unwillingness to acknowledge
other methodological approaches in the field of business and
management research, young academics are faced with an
unsurmountable difficulty with using alternative philosophical
paradigms and research designs” (Baranchenko & Yukhanaev,
2013: 27)

This is a somewhat different situation to the Italian experience
for example where qualitative research has had a long tradition
(Bruni & Gobo, 2005).

There has also been an emphasis on different types of methods
in different European contexts. For example in the UK classic
organizational ethnographies were produced during the 1960's and
1970's (e.g. Benyon, 1973; Lupton, 1963), whereas in Italy ethnog-
raphy has had an enduringly long tradition (Bruni & Gobo, 2005).
Angermüller (2006) highlights how the French have particularly
made a major contribution to the development of post-
structuralism and discourse analysis through the work of writers
like Foucault and Lacan. This diversity is important because as
Buchanan and Bryman (2007) highlight, the more recent method-
ological innovation within the field of management and

organizational research more generally has been located around
qualitative and interpretive methods. There are a variety that could
be mentioned here, but particularly pertinent examples are more
recent applications of story and narrative analysis to organizational
research (e.g.: Beech, 2008; Gabriel & Griffiths, 2004; Ylijoki, 2005;
Humphreys & Brown, 2002); developments in discourse and
rhetorical analysis (e.g.: Symon, 2008; Jørgensen, Jordan, &
Mitterhofer, 2012; Shepherd & Challenger, 2013) and the use of
visual methods in organizational research (e.g. Davison, McLean, &
Warren, 2012).

Hence the European tradition of qualitative research can be
characterised as being informed by a range of different philo-
sophical underpinnings; a variety of methods and a history of
methodological innovation and different sets of epistemic and
methodological traditions across the continent. Why is this di-
versity important? My argument is that methodological pluralism
offers a wider range of opportunities for investigating different
types of research questions hence presenting more opportunities
for insights into different managerial phenomena. Therefore any
methodological restrictions would only serve to limit our potential
for understanding the complexities of managementmore generally.

3. A cautionary tale of standardisation

Having highlighted the rich diversity of qualitative European
research, at this point I wish to highlight a source of concern for
qualitative management researchers that relates to a variety of
increasing pressures for the standardisation of qualitative research.
There is evidence of a move in this direction. For example, in
seeking to address the difficulties in publishing qualitative research
that have been identified by some qualitative management re-
searchers, a number of editors of esteemed journals have produced
guidelines regarding what makes a quality piece of qualitative
research. These guidelines usually start fromwhat are perceived as
common problems in the submissions of qualitative researchers.
For example Gephart (2004) identifies these as papers being ‘one-
off’ rather than embedded in ongoing research programmes; lack of
adequate literature reviews; failure to state explicit goals or
research questions; lack of conceptual definition; under-
specification of methodology; and failing to re-visit research
questions or goals in the discussion and conclusions sections.
Similarly Pratt (2009: 857) identifies some ‘dangerous paths’ to
follow that will ‘limit an author's ability to publish her or his
qualitative research’. He provides a series of alternative paths to
compensate for the lack of a ‘boilerplate’ or a ‘standardized lan-
guage’ for writing up qualitative research. Although these recom-
mendations are there to help qualitative writers, one could argue
that such guidelines lead to the production of formulaic pieces of
research which can have negative consequences given the diversity
of methodological approaches highlighted earlier, a point recog-
nised within the most recent of these editorials from the Academy
of Management Journal (AMJ) (see Bansal and Corley, 2012).

Furthermore, potential pressures for standardisation are
apparent in the recommendations for progress that emerge from
those such as Bluhm et al. (2011). Within that paper the progress
that qualitative management research has made during the last ten
years is equated with citation counts. Given that papers in the
American Academy journals are more highly cited than others, and
that these papers are judged to have a greater methodological
transparency than their European counterparts, the authors
conclude that:

“Given the progress that can be made in qualitative manage-
ment research through higher standards of transparency of
methods and analysis, we recommend that European journals
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