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Background: Awide variety of speech and language disorders has been known to exist. These

disorders impair the ability to communicate to different extent so as to adversely affect

social, emotional and functional well-being of a person. In literature, little has been

documented about types of various such disorders and their frequency of occurrence. Less

is known about pattern of such patients seeking speech language assessment and thera-

peutic services. Hence need of the present study.

Method: Data was collected from a total 6707 patients reporting with communication

difficulty to Audiology and Speech Language Pathology wing of ENT department, GGS

Medical College Hospital, Faridkot, a tertiary care hospital of Punjab, India. Patients' data

were classified depending on (a) age, (b) gender, and (c) diagnosis.

Results: Maximum number of patients was aged below 10 years of age which accounted to

approximately 43% of the total patients with speech and language difficulties. The number

of patients was observed to reduce as age increased. Mis-articulation was most common

among all disorders in the first two decades of life where as stuttering was maximally

evident in the young age group (21–30 years). Voice related difficulties weremost affecting in

the middle age groups (31–50 years).

Conclusions: Results of the present study would be useful in guiding administrative authori-

ties to establish adequate and suitable infrastructure, employment of disability specific

professionals and manpower, proper planning and execution in order to accommodate

variety of case load. Awareness program or meetings can be arranged to make the co-

professionals (doctors, nurses, and other para-medical staffs) well versed with a Speech

Language Pathologist's scope of practice.
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1. Introduction

A wide variety of speech and language disorders has been
known to exist. These disorders impair the ability to
communicate to different extent so as to adversely affect
social, emotional and functional well-being of a person.
Communication disorders can be of many types and pre-
sentations affecting both speech aswell as language. Impaired
production of speech (misarticulation), disturbed fluency
(stuttering, cluttering, normal non-fluency, etc.), and voice
disorders are few among the communication disorders. These
disorders also include language impairment like aphasia.
Language disorders also include inability to follow/maintain
the form, content, and the function of language.1 These
disorders occur in children, adults, and people of old age.
Speech language disorders are reported to be among the most
common childhood impairments which affect 1 in every 12
children or 5–8% of pre-school children.2 Among the adult and
elderly population, the impact of communication disorders is
equally disturbing. National Institute of Neurological Dis-
orders and Stroke estimated one million people in the United
States suffering from aphasia.3 Adults with language disorder
such as aphasia are found to have fewer contacts with siblings
and loss of friends.4 In literature, little has been documented
about types of various such disorders and their frequency of
occurrence. Less is known about pattern of such patients
seeking speech language assessment and therapeutic services.
The present study aimed at a systematic process to find out (a)
various types of speech and language disorders reporting at a
tertiary care hospital attached to a medical college and (b)
percentage of different types of disorders. Reporting such
simple statistical data may not be greatly exciting to the
clinicians but certainly has a reasonable potential to contrib-
ute in making budgetary decisions for research activities,
better administrative controls, and in general broad public
interest. The authors feel that the statistics and discussion in
this article will help professionals from medical as well as
administrative fraternity across the country to understand the
wide arena of speech and language disorders and therefore to
facilitate adequate referral and related regulations.

2. Method

2.1. Study design

The present study is a retrospective observational study.

2.2. Participants

Datawere collected froma total of 6707 patients reportingwith
communication difficulty to Audiology and Speech Language
Pathology unit of ENT department, GGS Medical College
Hospital, Faridkot, a tertiary care hospital of Punjab, India.
The study covered all patients between 1st August 2013 and
31st July 2016, i.e., for a span of 3 years. Patients' data were
classified depending on (a) age, (b) gender, and (c) diagnosis. All
the patients were diagnosed by experienced Speech Language
Pathologists (SLPs) working at the hospital.

3. Results and discussion

Datawere tabulated for 6707 patients of which 4292 weremale
and 2415were female. Approximately, 64%of the total patients
were male and 36% were female. In literature male to female
ratio of speech language disorders has been reported be as
high as 2.30:1.5 Similar findings were reported by other
researchers also.6

3.1. Disorders at different age groups

All patients reporting with speech and language problems
aged between 2 and 65 years were included in the present
study. The patients were categorized under six age groups (0–
10 years, 11–20 years, 21–30 years, 31–40 years, 41–50 years, and
above 50 years). Maximumnumber of patients was aged below
10 years of age (Fig. 1), which accounted to approximately 43%
of the total patients with speech and language difficulties.
Higher age groups had lesser number of patients. All possible
pairs of the age groups in terms of number of patients were
significantly different (Chi square value: 3800.20; p < 0.001).
This pattern is indicative of the fact that burden of
communication disorders declines with age. This could be
due to two reasons: (1) parental concern for their children to
achieve normal speech and language skills in early stages of
life facilitated professional consultation and (2) such difficul-
ties were under reported at later stages of life due to busywork
schedule and lifestyle. Surprisingly, there is a slight increase
(Fig. 1) in the total number of patients above 50 years of age.
This could be due to thatwe included all patients above the age
of 50 years in this group and no further age group was defined.
All the patients in this group had either dysarthria or a voice
related issue. Voice related issues could be due to age related
changes in laryngeal functioning. Motor speech disorders
involving the nervous systemare also very commonat this age
group due to stroke, brain injury, etc. Misarticulationwasmost
common among all disorders in the first two decades of life
whereas stuttering was maximally evident in the young age
group (21–30 years). Voice-related difficulties were most
affecting in the middle age groups (31–50 years). This can be
attributed to professional use of voice aswell as vocal abuse by
females during household activities as they remain the most
active during this period of life.
[(Fig._1)TD$FIG]

Fig. 1 – Agewise distribution of patients having speech
language disorders.
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